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Two new exhibits open at the QArts Gallery October 19

Guess Who I Saw Today explores the relationship between craftsmanship and the 
expression of the human condition through art. Featuring the artists DaNice Mar-
shall, Matt Brackett, and Arnaya Needleman, this show weaves together elements 
of history, contemporary issues, and technological advancements to provide a 
nuanced exploration of the creative process. By delving into these subjects, the 
exhibition offers viewers a window into the ways in which art can serve as a pow-
erful lens for examining our shared human experiences. Viewers are encouraged 
to contemplate the ways in which creativity can inspire meaningful dialogue.

The exhibition is curated by Ashleigh Dior Coren. Coren is a content strategist, 
educator, and curator based in the Washington, D.C. area. A Dorchester native, 
Ashleigh has worked for the Smithsonian, the University of Maryland, College 
Park, and the Institute of Contemporary Art, Boston.

In addition, the Quincy Art Association’s Member of the Month Showcase fea-
tures masterful oils by Quincy resident Kris Kreitman. 

A reception at the QArts Gallery is planned for Saturday, October 19, 5-7 p.m. 
Public is cordially invited. Free event, light refreshments served. Many works in 
both exhibits will be available for sale. The exhibitions run through November 23.

QAA’s talented vendor members offer original works and matted prints, hand-
made jewelry, stunning ceramics, note cards, and other locally made items, 
offered for purchase in the QArts Gallery Gift Shop.

Looking for classes this fall? At the QAA studios, located at 26 High School 
Ave., we are offering classes for children, teens, and adults taught by our talented 
and accomplished member faculty. You’ll certainly find something that scratches 
your creative itch. Details and easy online registration is now open. Visit quincy-
artma.org/classes.

Thank you to The City of Quincy, Mass Cultural Council, The Janet Burke Mann 
Foundation, Granite City Electric Supply Company/WAC Lighting, Quirk Auto 
Dealerships, Dream Realty, Foxrock Properties, Eastern Bank, Northeast Commu-
nity Bank, Colonial Federal Savings Bank, Altrusa, and Wollaston Wine & Spirits, 
for their support of the QAA. 

The QArts Gallery, 1229 Hancock St., Quincy, MA 02169 (across from Quincy 
College). Email: info@quincyartma.org. For more information about the gallery, 
classes, events, and other news, please visit www.quincyartma.org


